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Earvin "Magic" Johnson Jr. is a retired American professional basketball
player and coach. He played point guard for the Los Angeles Lakers in the
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National Basketball Association (NBA) for 13 seasons. Johnson is widely
considered to be one of the greatest basketball players of all time. He was
inducted into the Naismith Memorial Basketball Hall of Fame in 2002 and
was named to the NBA's 50 Greatest Players in NBA History list in 1996.
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Johnson was born in Lansing, Michigan, in 1959. He began playing
basketball at an early age and quickly developed into a standout player. He
led his high school team to three state championships and was named
Michigan's Mr. Basketball in 1977.

Johnson was recruited by many top college basketball programs, but he
ultimately decided to play for Michigan State University. He had a
successful two-year career with the Spartans, leading them to a Big Ten
Championship in 1979.

Johnson was selected first overall by the Los Angeles Lakers in the 1979
NBA Draft. He quickly became a star player, leading the Lakers to their first
NBA championship in 1980. Johnson was named the NBA Finals Most
Valuable Player (MVP) that year.
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Johnson continued to play at a high level throughout his career, winning
four more NBA championships with the Lakers (1982, 1985, 1987, and
1988). He was also named the NBA MVP three times (1987, 1989, and
1990).

Johnson retired from the NBA in 1991 after being diagnosed with HIV. He
later returned to the NBA as a coach, leading the Lakers to the NBA
championship in 2000.

Since retiring from the NBA, Johnson has been involved in a variety of
business and philanthropic endeavors. He is the owner of the Los Angeles
Sparks of the WNBA and a part-owner of the Los Angeles Dodgers of Major
League Baseball. He is also a special adviser to the president of basketball
operations for the Lakers.

Johnson is a role model for many people, both on and off the court. He is a
successful businessman, a philanthropist, and a loving father and husband.
He is also a strong advocate for HIV/AIDS awareness and prevention.

Magic Johnson's Accomplishments

* 5x NBA champion (1980, 1982, 1985, 1987, 1988) * 3x NBA Finals MVP
(1980, 1982, 1987) * 3x NBA MVP (1987, 1989, 1990) * 12x NBA All-Star
(1980-1991) * 10x All-NBA First Team (1983-1991) * 2x All-NBA Second
Team (1980-1982) * NBA All-Rookie First Team (1980) * Naismith Memorial
Basketball Hall of Fame (2002) * NBA's 50 Greatest Players in NBA History
(1996)

Magic Johnson's Legacy



Magic Johnson is one of the most successful and influential basketball
players of all time. He was a gifted player who could do it all on the court.
He was a great scorer, passer, rebounder, and defender. He was also a
charismatic leader who knew how to get the best out of his teammates.

Johnson's accomplishments on the court are undeniable. He won five NBA
championships, three NBA Finals MVPs, and three NBA MVPs. He was
also a 12-time NBA All-Star and a 10-time All-NBA First Team selection.

Beyond his accomplishments on the court, Johnson is also a role model for
many people. He is a successful businessman, a philanthropist, and a
loving father and husband. He is also a strong advocate for HIV/AIDS
awareness and prevention.

Magic Johnson is a true American icon. He is a symbol of success,
achievement, and hope. He is an inspiration to millions of people around
the world.

Additional Information

* Magic Johnson's official website: https://www.magicjohnson.com/ * Magic
Johnson's NBA profile: https://www.nba.com/players/magic-johnson/ *
Magic Johnson's Naismith Memorial Basketball Hall of Fame profile:
https://www.hoophall.com/hall-of-famers/magic-johnson/
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